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Who Is This Vendor Assessment For? 
NelsonHall’s Intelligent Automation Services in Banking Vendor Assessment 
for Mindtree is a comprehensive assessment of Mindtree’s Intelligent 
Automation in Banking offerings and capabilities designed for: 

• Sourcing managers monitoring the capabilities of existing suppliers of 
intelligent automation processes and identifying vendor suitability for 
intelligent automation services RFPs 

• Vendor marketing, sales and business managers looking to benchmark 
themselves against their peers 

• Financial analysts and investors specializing in the support services 
sector. 

Key Findings & Highlights 
Mindtree was formed in 1999 to offer application development and R&D 
services. It then broadened its portfolio to include software testing and 
managed services. Today, Mindtree provides services for process 
automation,  e-commerce, mobile applications, cloud computing, digital 
transformation, data analytics, software testing, application integration, and 
ERP. In June 2019, Larsen & Toubro took a 61% controlling interest in the 
company.  

Mindtree focuses its intelligent automation services on automating industry-
specific processes. It began offering process automation services in 2015 in 
support of its managed services engagements globally. Mindtree started with 
RPA scripts, advanced into automation models, and today it delivers hyper-
automation (cloud-delivered automation) services. 

 

Scope of the Report 
The report provides a comprehensive and objective analysis of intelligent 
automation services offerings, capabilities, and market and financial 
strength, including: 

• Identification of the company’s strategy, emphases and new 
developments 

• Analysis of the company’s strengths, weaknesses and outlook 

• Revenue estimates 

• Analysis of the profile of the company’s customer base including the 
company’s targeting strategy and examples of current contracts 

• Analysis of the company’s offerings and key service components 

• Analysis of the company’s delivery organization including the location of 
delivery locations. 
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